
 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

1 6 EA 10060 BLADE W S W          26" $3.11 $3.58 $6.00 $3.06 No Bid No Bid

31-26  

ANCO 50-26   

2 120 EA 10065 WIPER BLADE ANCO 31-22 $3.11 $3.58 $5.00 $3.06 No Bid No Bid

THIS IS A UNIVERSAL WIPER BLADE THAT  

FITS HOOK TYPE, PIN TYPE, AND STRAIGHT  

END TYPE WIPER ARM.  

3 20 EA 10067 WIPER BLADE 31-24 $3.11 $3.58 $5.49 $3.06 No Bid No Bid

4 6 EA 10089 WIPER BLADE 22B No Bid $3.58 No Bid $8.56 No Bid No Bid

PASSENGER SIDE  

5 11 EA 10094 WIPER BLADE ANCO 31-21 $3.11 $3.58 $4.49 $3.06 No Bid No Bid

NAPA NP21  

6 8 EA 10375 EXHAUST BAND CLAMP 4" $10.72 $9.97 $14.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid

NAPA 733-5976  

7 2 EA 10785 TURN SIGNAL SWITCH KIT $95.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

THOMAS TBB DAC TS012  

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

1 6 EA 10060 BLADE W S W          26"

31-26

ANCO 50-26

2 120 EA 10065 WIPER BLADE ANCO 31-22

THIS IS A UNIVERSAL WIPER BLADE THAT

FITS HOOK TYPE, PIN TYPE, AND STRAIGHT

END TYPE WIPER ARM.

3 20 EA 10067 WIPER BLADE 31-24

4 6 EA 10089 WIPER BLADE 22B

PASSENGER SIDE

5 11 EA 10094 WIPER BLADE ANCO 31-21

NAPA NP21

6 8 EA 10375 EXHAUST BAND CLAMP 4"

NAPA 733-5976

7 2 EA 10785 TURN SIGNAL SWITCH KIT

THOMAS TBB DAC TS012

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

   



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

8 24 EA 11048 BULB TUNGSTEN HALOGEN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1000W 120V 254MM R7S  

LB-M10 (FIRE RESEARCH CORP.)  

9 20 EA 11050 DROP LIGHT BULB No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

NAPA 782-7013  75W 120V  

NAPA 58517   

10 3 EA 11059 BULB LIGHT QUARTZ HALOGEN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Q1500T3-CL240   1500W  

DAMAR #1024A  1500T3QCL   

11 40 EA 11061 BULB                 3157 $9.49 $0.46 No Bid $0.70 No Bid No Bid

MADE IN USA ONLY   

12 20 EA 11062 BULB               3157NA No Bid $1.00 No Bid $1.54 No Bid No Bid

MADE IN USA ONLY  

13 33 EA 11118 BULB                 9007 $3.04 $3.14 $5.98 $4.56 No Bid No Bid

14 4 EA 11119 BULB SEALBEAM HIGH BEAM $6.24 $8.95 $9.69 $15.93 No Bid No Bid

H4651   
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 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

8 24 EA 11048 BULB TUNGSTEN HALOGEN

1000W 120V 254MM R7S

LB-M10 (FIRE RESEARCH CORP.)

9 20 EA 11050 DROP LIGHT BULB

NAPA 782-7013  75W 120V

NAPA 58517

10 3 EA 11059 BULB LIGHT QUARTZ HALOGEN

 Q1500T3-CL240   1500W

DAMAR #1024A  1500T3QCL

11 40 EA 11061 BULB                 3157

MADE IN USA ONLY

12 20 EA 11062 BULB               3157NA

MADE IN USA ONLY

13 33 EA 11118 BULB                 9007

14 4 EA 11119 BULB SEALBEAM HIGH BEAM

H4651

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

FORD 1234   CHEVY 4567  

15 2 EA 11400 ELECTRIC FUEL PUMP $37.99 No Bid $48.99 $134.35 No Bid No Bid

NAPA E8012S  

12V, 5.5-9 PSI, 2 WIRE   

16 2 EA 11624 CUTTING HEAD WEEDEATER No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

STIHL 4002 710 2191  

17 6 EA 11656 BLADE MOWER JOHN DEERE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid

TCU 15882    72"   Z950M   

7-06719   

18 6 EA 11705 SWITCH, PTO (DECK) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

483957              SCAG   

OLD # 481687  

19 6 EA 11712 CUTTER BLADE STTII72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

482882         SCAG  

20 66 EA 11733 CUTTER BLADE 21"   482881 $35.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

FOR SCAG STT61 (481708)   



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

FORD 1234   CHEVY 4567

15 2 EA 11400 ELECTRIC FUEL PUMP

NAPA E8012S

12V, 5.5-9 PSI, 2 WIRE

16 2 EA 11624 CUTTING HEAD WEEDEATER

STIHL 4002 710 2191

17 6 EA 11656 BLADE MOWER JOHN DEERE

TCU 15882    72"   Z950M

7-06719

18 6 EA 11705 SWITCH, PTO (DECK)

483957              SCAG

OLD # 481687

19 6 EA 11712 CUTTER BLADE STTII72

482882         SCAG

20 66 EA 11733 CUTTER BLADE 21"   482881

FOR SCAG STT61 (481708)

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid

     

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

NAPA 7-04793   

21 5 EA 11734 BLADE DRIVE BELT   481980 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

FOR SCAG STT72  

BLADERUNNER 6741BR   

22 9 EA 11735 CUTTER BLADE 24"  481709 $44.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

FOR SCAG STT72   

NAPA 7-04955   

23 4 EA 11744 GREASE CAP   481559 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

                    SCAG   

24 10 EA 11746 SLOTTTED NUT (BLADE) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

00020900           ALAMO  

25 10 EA 11747 BLADE BOLT 02782900 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

                   ALAMO

26 8 EA 11748 LOCKWASHER 02957089 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid

                   ALAMO
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 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

NAPA 7-04793

21 5 EA 11734 BLADE DRIVE BELT   481980

FOR SCAG STT72

BLADERUNNER 6741BR

22 9 EA 11735 CUTTER BLADE 24"  481709

FOR SCAG STT72

NAPA 7-04955

23 4 EA 11744 GREASE CAP   481559

                    SCAG

24 10 EA 11746 SLOTTTED NUT (BLADE)

00020900           ALAMO

25 10 EA 11747 BLADE BOLT 02782900

                   ALAMO

26 8 EA 11748 LOCKWASHER 02957089

                   ALAMO

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

27 10 EA 11749 ROLL PIN 00023200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

                   ALAMO

28 1 EA 11758 KNIFE HEAD # 1874 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

FOR ALAMO MDL # H2576R  

29 1 EA 11764 KNUCKLE BOLT NUT 1421 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALAMO MDL# H2576R

30 8 EA 11781 MOWER BLADE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2Z01S140           SPIDER  

31 4 EA 11829 CUTTER BLADE 1/2X4X23 CW No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

820-170C  LEFT WING

32 10 EA 11830 CUTTER BLADE 1/2X4X29 CCW No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

820-168C  CENTER

33 4 EA 11831 CUTTER BLADE 1/2X4X23 CCW No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

820-169C  RIGHT WING  

34 8 EA 11832 BLADE BOLT KIT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

318-586A LANDPRIDE



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

27 10 EA 11749 ROLL PIN 00023200

                   ALAMO

28 1 EA 11758 KNIFE HEAD # 1874

FOR ALAMO MDL # H2576R

29 1 EA 11764 KNUCKLE BOLT NUT 1421

ALAMO MDL# H2576R

30 8 EA 11781 MOWER BLADE

2Z01S140           SPIDER

31 4 EA 11829 CUTTER BLADE 1/2X4X23 CW

820-170C  LEFT WING

32 10 EA 11830 CUTTER BLADE 1/2X4X29 CCW

820-168C  CENTER

33 4 EA 11831 CUTTER BLADE 1/2X4X23 CCW

820-169C  RIGHT WING

34 8 EA 11832 BLADE BOLT KIT

318-586A LANDPRIDE

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

35 2 EA 11855 DOUBLE SIDED AXE BLADE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

755-5051 MOWER MAX

36 4 EA 11945 MOWER BLADE 06521001 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

              TIGER MOWER   

37 6 EA 11946 BLADE BOLT    06538000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

              TIGER MOWER  

38 4 EA 11947 SPACER  34878 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

              TIGER MOWER  

39 6 EA 13082 FILTER AIR $11.88 $14.57 $8.49 $19.00 No Bid No Bid

CA8004    NAPA6418  

40 2 EA 13086 FILTER AIR $11.88 $13.61 $6.49 $19.00 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA2487  

41 2 EA 13095 FILTER AIR $48.51 $53.88 $57.12 $77.61 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA6870  

42 4 EA 13106 FILTER AIR OUTER $52.20 $57.97 $61.29 $83.51 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA2803



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

35 2 EA 11855 DOUBLE SIDED AXE BLADE

755-5051 MOWER MAX

36 4 EA 11945 MOWER BLADE 06521001

              TIGER MOWER

37 6 EA 11946 BLADE BOLT    06538000

              TIGER MOWER

38 4 EA 11947 SPACER  34878

              TIGER MOWER

39 6 EA 13082 FILTER AIR

CA8004    NAPA6418

40 2 EA 13086 FILTER AIR

          NAPA2487

41 2 EA 13095 FILTER AIR

          NAPA6870

42 4 EA 13106 FILTER AIR OUTER

          NAPA2803

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

43 4 EA 13124 FILTER AIR $23.58 $24.55 $28.51 $37.72 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA6807  

44 10 EA 13129 FILTER AIR $11.88 $13.77 $9.25 $19.00 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA9883  

45 2 EA 13151 FILTER CABIN AIR MACK No Bid $40.08 $37.57 $57.81 No Bid No Bid

82745222  

46 11 EA 13152 FILTER AIR $13.86 $30.14 $12.73 $22.18 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA9756  

47 5 EA 13232 FILTER FUEL $6.69 $7.26 $8.08 $10.50 No Bid No Bid

P1147     NAPA3120  

48 5 EA 13262 FILTER FUEL FREIGHTLINER $29.07 $32.35 No Bid $46.50 No Bid No Bid

ABP/S3226FL02  NAPA 3812  

THIS IS A RAYCOR STYLE FUEL WATER  

SEPERATOR FILTER THAT HAS A GLASS BOWL   

ON THE BOTTOM.  



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

43 4 EA 13124 FILTER AIR

          NAPA6807

44 10 EA 13129 FILTER AIR

          NAPA9883

45 2 EA 13151 FILTER CABIN AIR MACK

82745222

46 11 EA 13152 FILTER AIR

          NAPA9756

47 5 EA 13232 FILTER FUEL

P1147     NAPA3120

48 5 EA 13262 FILTER FUEL FREIGHTLINER

ABP/S3226FL02  NAPA 3812

THIS IS A RAYCOR STYLE FUEL WATER

SEPERATOR FILTER THAT HAS A GLASS BOWL

ON THE BOTTOM.

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

49 4 EA 13264 FILTER FUEL $9.36 $10.50 $11.51 $14.97 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA3377  

50 11 EA 13268 FILTER FUEL $5.34 $8.42 $8.24 $11.10 No Bid No Bid

BF7668    NAPA3595  

51 6 EA 13271 FILTER FUEL $26.46 $28.94 $31.59 $41.68 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA3604  

52 6 EA 13275 FILTER FUEL $28.39 $28.94 $31.59 $45.42 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA3604XE  

53 4 EA 13280 FILTER FUEL $12.51 $14.05 $15.21 $20.01 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA3719  

54 5 EA 13287 FILTER FUEL  FLEETGUARD $28.03 $30.85 $33.44 $44.85 No Bid No Bid

FS1065     NAPA3965   

55 2 EA 13291 FILTER HYDRAULIC No Bid $6.92 $7.29 $9.93 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA1551  

56 2 EA 13329 FILTER FUEL MITSUBISHI No Bid $23.10 $25.04 $34.26 No Bid No Bid

ME306306  



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

49 4 EA 13264 FILTER FUEL

          NAPA3377

50 11 EA 13268 FILTER FUEL

BF7668    NAPA3595

51 6 EA 13271 FILTER FUEL

          NAPA3604

52 6 EA 13275 FILTER FUEL

          NAPA3604XE

53 4 EA 13280 FILTER FUEL

          NAPA3719

54 5 EA 13287 FILTER FUEL  FLEETGUARD

FS1065     NAPA3965  

55 2 EA 13291 FILTER HYDRAULIC

          NAPA1551

56 2 EA 13329 FILTER FUEL MITSUBISHI

ME306306

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

57 22 EA 13337 FILTER FUEL $18.64 $30.51 $33.47 $43.41 No Bid No Bid

           NAPA3995  

BALDWIN BF1386-0    

58 26 EA 13345 FILTER FUEL/WATER SEP. $18.22 $33.15 $34.77 $50.46 No Bid No Bid

         ABP/N122-R50419   

THIS IS FLOW THRU FUEL WATER SEPERATOR  

SUCH AS RACOR WITH GLASS BOWL. A SPIN ON   

SOLID FILTER IS NOT ACCEPTABLE.  

59 2 EA 13346 FILTER FUEL $16.29 $18.71 $19.65 $26.06 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA3628  

60 1 EA 13350 FILTER FUEL/WATER SEP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17201956    VOLVO  

61 8 EA 13360 FUEL WATER SEPERATOR $155.67 $93.07 $101.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid

INTERNATIONAL  4080114C2  

62 3 EA 13363 FUEL WATER SEPERATOR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

KUBOTA    RD451-51940  



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

57 22 EA 13337 FILTER FUEL

           NAPA3995

BALDWIN BF1386-0

58 26 EA 13345 FILTER FUEL/WATER SEP.

         ABP/N122-R50419

THIS IS FLOW THRU FUEL WATER SEPERATOR

SUCH AS RACOR WITH GLASS BOWL. A SPIN ON

SOLID FILTER IS NOT ACCEPTABLE.

59 2 EA 13346 FILTER FUEL

          NAPA3628

60 1 EA 13350 FILTER FUEL/WATER SEP

17201956    VOLVO

61 8 EA 13360 FUEL WATER SEPERATOR

INTERNATIONAL  4080114C2

62 3 EA 13363 FUEL WATER SEPERATOR

KUBOTA    RD451-51940

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

63 3 EA 13366 FILTER FUEL PERKINS $19.98 $21.94 $23.30 $31.96 No Bid No Bid

4816636  

64 3 EA 13408 FILTER OIL $2.54 $4.73 $2.99 $6.34 No Bid No Bid

PH43      NAPA1068  

65 6 EA 13410 FILTER OIL $2.05 $4.85 $3.23 $6.34 No Bid No Bid

PH8A      NAPA1515   

66 48 EA 13421 FILTER OIL     AC PF40 $3.96 $4.65 $2.79 $6.34 No Bid No Bid

PH3387A   NAPA1040  

67 9 EA 13431 FILTER OIL $5.20 $5.10 $3.29 $6.34 No Bid No Bid

PH13 /PH5 NAPA1061 1060  

PH5 AND PH13 SAME (PH5 HAS THE ANTIDRAIN   

CHECK VALVE)  

68 52 EA 13434 FILTER OIL $8.77 $9.84 $3.49 $14.03 No Bid No Bid

PH49      NAPA1791              

69 1 EA 13441 FILTER OIL $6.17 $6.23 $7.25 $9.42 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA1602  



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

63 3 EA 13366 FILTER FUEL PERKINS

4816636

64 3 EA 13408 FILTER OIL

PH43      NAPA1068

65 6 EA 13410 FILTER OIL

PH8A      NAPA1515

66 48 EA 13421 FILTER OIL     AC PF40

PH3387A   NAPA1040

67 9 EA 13431 FILTER OIL

PH13 /PH5 NAPA1061 1060

PH5 AND PH13 SAME (PH5 HAS THE ANTIDRAIN

CHECK VALVE)

68 52 EA 13434 FILTER OIL

PH49      NAPA1791

69 1 EA 13441 FILTER OIL

          NAPA1602

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

                                                            

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

70 12 EA 13446 FILTER OIL $3.96 $5.47 $2.85 $6.34 No Bid No Bid

PH3600    NAPA1516  

71 251 EA 13450 FILTER OIL $2.05 $4.71 $2.59 $6.34 No Bid No Bid

PH820     NAPA1372  

72 4 EA 13452 FILTER OIL $13.39 $14.29 $15.72 $21.38 No Bid No Bid

PH7405    NAPA1971   

73 11 EA 13455 FILTER OIL MERCEDES-BENZ $10.98 $14.02 $14.85 $20.22 No Bid No Bid

A 000 180 17 09  NAPA7215  BALDWIN P7188  

74 17 EA 13467 FILTER OIL $2.06 $4.58 No Bid $6.34 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA1042  

75 12 EA 13474 FILTER OIL TOYOTA ONLY $3.96 No Bid No Bid $6.34 No Bid No Bid

90915-YZZF2  

76 2 EA 13482 FILTER OIL $18.22 $20.81 $21.40 $29.15 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA7213  

77 10 EA 13490 FILTER OIL $3.96 $4.94 $5.26 $6.34 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA1365  



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

70 12 EA 13446 FILTER OIL

PH3600    NAPA1516

71 251 EA 13450 FILTER OIL

PH820     NAPA1372

72 4 EA 13452 FILTER OIL

PH7405    NAPA1971

73 11 EA 13455 FILTER OIL MERCEDES-BENZ

A 000 180 17 09  NAPA7215  BALDWIN P7188

74 17 EA 13467 FILTER OIL

          NAPA1042

75 12 EA 13474 FILTER OIL TOYOTA ONLY

90915-YZZF2

76 2 EA 13482 FILTER OIL

          NAPA7213

77 10 EA 13490 FILTER OIL

          NAPA1365

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

78 6 EA 13494 FILTER OIL $5.20 $4.53 $4.65 $6.34 No Bid No Bid

          NAPA 100255  

79 3 EA 14025 BACKUP LIGHT CLEAR $4.81 $5.19 $9.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid

NAPA 4041W  

TRUCK LITE 40204   

80 2 EA 14026 TAILLIGHT ASY DRIVER SIDE $19.69 $10.84 $44.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid

NAPA 4013 PM442   

K-D 257-2627 Grote 50912  

81 2 EA 14048 BULB S/T/T SNAP-IN-DUAL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

FILAMENT WHELEN STOPSN12  

NAPA/ TRUCK-LITE 60-25123   

82 4 EA 14128 LAMP STOP, TAIL, & TURN $19.69 $22.33 $61.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid

RH W/SINGLE METRI-PACK  

CONNECTOR ON LEFT   

GROTE 53702, K-D 257-2634,TRUCKLIGHT  

80380R, SIG-STAT 5316Y101  



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

78 6 EA 13494 FILTER OIL

          NAPA 100255

79 3 EA 14025 BACKUP LIGHT CLEAR

NAPA 4041W

TRUCK LITE 40204

80 2 EA 14026 TAILLIGHT ASY DRIVER SIDE

NAPA 4013 PM442

K-D 257-2627 Grote 50912

81 2 EA 14048 BULB S/T/T SNAP-IN-DUAL

FILAMENT WHELEN STOPSN12

NAPA/ TRUCK-LITE 60-25123

82 4 EA 14128 LAMP STOP, TAIL, & TURN

RH W/SINGLE METRI-PACK

CONNECTOR ON LEFT

GROTE 53702, K-D 257-2634,TRUCKLIGHT

80380R, SIG-STAT 5316Y101

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

83 4 EA 14129 LAMP STOP, TAIL, & TURN $19.69 $29.48 $49.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid

LH W/ DOUBLE METRI-PACK CONNECTORS  

GROTE 53762, K-D 257-2635, TRUCKLIGHT   

80383R, SIG-STAT 5315Y101  NAPA 53762  

84 6 EA 14140 LIGHT S/T/T 4" RED W/18 No Bid $13.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

LED ROUND   

85 3 EA 14153 LIGHT 3 HEAD LED CLEAR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12-24VDC     730-7968  

86 1 EA 14154 LIGHT 3 HEAD LED AMBER No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

WARNING 12-24VDC 730-7992  

87 24 EA 15122 FITTING HYD 1/4" MALE PIP $9.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

G25100-0404 GATES  

88 50 FT 15130 HOSE HYD 1/2"   2 STRAND $9.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.87 No Bid

H42508 OR GATES 85602  

NEW PN 8MXTXREEL / 70283 - NAPA/GATES



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

83 4 EA 14129 LAMP STOP, TAIL, & TURN

LH W/ DOUBLE METRI-PACK CONNECTORS

GROTE 53762, K-D 257-2635, TRUCKLIGHT

80383R, SIG-STAT 5315Y101  NAPA 53762

84 6 EA 14140 LIGHT S/T/T 4" RED W/18

LED ROUND

85 3 EA 14153 LIGHT 3 HEAD LED CLEAR

12-24VDC     730-7968

86 1 EA 14154 LIGHT 3 HEAD LED AMBER

WARNING 12-24VDC 730-7992

87 24 EA 15122 FITTING HYD 1/4" MALE PIP

G25100-0404 GATES

88 50 FT 15130 HOSE HYD 1/2"   2 STRAND

H42508 OR GATES 85602

NEW PN 8MXTXREEL / 70283 - NAPA/GATES

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

89 20 EA 15132 FITTING HYD 3/8" MALE JIC $14.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.77 No Bid

G25165-0606 GATES

90 4 EA 15145 FITTING HYD 3/8 X 90 JIC $32.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.74 No Bid

G25179-0606 GATES

91 5 EA 15148 MALE HOSE FITTING   1" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

PIRANHA J ML16P  

92 4 EA 15149 COUPLER QUICK CONNECT $31.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.82 No Bid

1/2" FEMALE BODY

PIONEER 4050-4  NAPA 725-1231  

93 4 EA 15152 COUPLER QUICK CONNECT $48.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.22 No Bid

3/4" MALE TIP

PIONEER 4110-5  NAPA 725-1282

94 4 EA 18855 WIPER ARM 6500-5642 $67.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

                   THOMAS

95 22 EA 18870 WIPER BLADE 1573682 $31.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

                 BLUEBIRD  



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

89 20 EA 15132 FITTING HYD 3/8" MALE JIC

G25165-0606 GATES

90 4 EA 15145 FITTING HYD 3/8 X 90 JIC

G25179-0606 GATES

91 5 EA 15148 MALE HOSE FITTING   1"

PIRANHA J ML16P

92 4 EA 15149 COUPLER QUICK CONNECT

1/2" FEMALE BODY

PIONEER 4050-4  NAPA 725-1231

93 4 EA 15152 COUPLER QUICK CONNECT

3/4" MALE TIP

PIONEER 4110-5  NAPA 725-1282

94 4 EA 18855 WIPER ARM 6500-5642

                   THOMAS

95 22 EA 18870 WIPER BLADE 1573682

                 BLUEBIRD

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

NAPA 62-256    

96 4 EA 18892 ENGINE BLOCK HEATER CORD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DUAL     1998038    

97 5 EA 18933 SEAT BACK COVER LEFT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

SSS0939BC007

COVER BACK ONLY,LT PROFORM II GRAY/NO

WELT

98 6 EA 18938 SEAT BELT WINDOW & AISLE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

FASTBEK-J  PN 501000003

590-000-00

99 6 EA 18940 SEAT BELT CENTER No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

FASTBEK-J  PN 501000005

AM SAFE PN 80190302  

590-001-00

100 3 EA 19116 SWITCH DOOR OPEN-CLOSE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

W/YELLOW ROCKER   17474



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

NAPA 62-256

96 4 EA 18892 ENGINE BLOCK HEATER CORD

DUAL     1998038

97 5 EA 18933 SEAT BACK COVER LEFT

SSS0939BC007

COVER BACK ONLY,LT PROFORM II GRAY/NO

WELT

98 6 EA 18938 SEAT BELT WINDOW & AISLE

FASTBEK-J  PN 501000003

590-000-00

99 6 EA 18940 SEAT BELT CENTER

FASTBEK-J  PN 501000005

AM SAFE PN 80190302

590-001-00

100 3 EA 19116 SWITCH DOOR OPEN-CLOSE

W/YELLOW ROCKER   17474

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

   



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

101 8 EA 19407 TIRE NEW ALL SEASON No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

195/75R16C

102 4 EA 19409 TIRE NEW ALL SEASON No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

225/65R17

103 14 EA 19544 TIRE NEW STEERING TREAD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

315/80R22.5 L/R J   ONLY

TREAD DEPTH 22/32  

MAXIMUM LOAD @ INFLATION  8270@120 SING   

7610@120 DUAL

SPEED RATED @ 75 MPH AT LEAST   

104 16 EA 19587 TIRE NEW MUD & SNOW No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11R22.5 L/R H (DRIVE POS)  

LOAD RANGE CHANGED TO H  

105 8 EA 19588 TIRE NEW ALL SEASON No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

P225/70R15 STANDARD LOAD No Bid

 



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

101 8 EA 19407 TIRE NEW ALL SEASON

195/75R16C

102 4 EA 19409 TIRE NEW ALL SEASON

225/65R17

103 14 EA 19544 TIRE NEW STEERING TREAD

315/80R22.5 L/R J   ONLY

TREAD DEPTH 22/32

MAXIMUM LOAD @ INFLATION  8270@120 SING

7610@120 DUAL

SPEED RATED @ 75 MPH AT LEAST

104 16 EA 19587 TIRE NEW MUD & SNOW

11R22.5 L/R H (DRIVE POS)

LOAD RANGE CHANGED TO H

105 8 EA 19588 TIRE NEW ALL SEASON

P225/70R15 STANDARD LOAD

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid $109.00 $110.00 $113.90

$99.00   

No Bid No Bid $89.00 $80.00 $91.75

$82.00   

No Bid No Bid $498.00 $350.00 $488.00

   

    

    

No Bid No Bid $355.00 $315.00 $355.00

  $298.00   

No Bid No Bid $101.00 $85.00 $114.46

$82.00



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

106 1 EA 19642 ALTERNATOR  GM/DELCO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

240 AMP  

107 33 EA 19902 KIT BRAKE REAR LELAND K70 $9.64 $14.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

OR ROCKWELL KIT 8000HD  

FOR ROCKWELL 16 1/2 " Q SERIES BRAKES    

KITS WITH KNURLED ROLLERS NOT ACCEPTABLE  

KIT MUST CONTAIN ROLLERS, BUSHINGS, PIN,   

AND SPRINGS  

ALSO USED ON Q-PLUS BRAKES   

108 5 EA 19997 D-2 GOVERNOR $10.08 $14.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

UNITED 66996   

109 5 EA 29901 DRAIN VALVE W/5 FT CABLE $4.20 $6.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

MIDLAND 12105  

110 1 ST 29912 BRAKE SHOE 16.5 X7 Q PLUS $60.23 $55.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

RELINED SET OF 4

 



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

106 1 EA 19642 ALTERNATOR  GM/DELCO

240 AMP

107 33 EA 19902 KIT BRAKE REAR LELAND K70

OR ROCKWELL KIT 8000HD

FOR ROCKWELL 16 1/2 " Q SERIES BRAKES

KITS WITH KNURLED ROLLERS NOT ACCEPTABLE

KIT MUST CONTAIN ROLLERS, BUSHINGS, PIN,

AND SPRINGS

ALSO USED ON Q-PLUS BRAKES

108 5 EA 19997 D-2 GOVERNOR

UNITED 66996

109 5 EA 29901 DRAIN VALVE W/5 FT CABLE

MIDLAND 12105

110 1 ST 29912 BRAKE SHOE 16.5 X7 Q PLUS

RELINED SET OF 4

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

     

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

111 16 EA 29936 GASKET FRONT HUB CAP $1.06 $12.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

330-3009 6-HOLE 6 1/4" OD  

4 7/8" ID, 5 1/2" BOLT RING, 3/8" HOLE  

112 1 EA 29967 DISC PAD SET FRONT No Bid $77.77 No Bid $81.00 No Bid No Bid

171-0977 DELCO  

113 1 EA 29971 DISC PAD SET - REAR No Bid No Bid No Bid $88.66 No Bid No Bid

171-1269 DELCO  

NAPA FT8523   

171-1269 supercedes  171-1032  

114 9 EA 20085 CHALK TREAD RUBBER No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid

WHITE  

115 48 CN 20145 FUEL QUICK START $6.79 $2.96 $4.99 No Bid No Bid $3.75

SPRAY 11 OZ (ETHER)  

116 576 CN 20185 CLEANER DISC BRAKE $2.99 $3.75 $2.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid

SPRAY 14 OZ

NON-CHLORINATED FOR USE ON DISC, DRUM,   



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

111 16 EA 29936 GASKET FRONT HUB CAP

330-3009 6-HOLE 6 1/4" OD

4 7/8" ID, 5 1/2" BOLT RING, 3/8" HOLE

112 1 EA 29967 DISC PAD SET FRONT

171-0977 DELCO

113 1 EA 29971 DISC PAD SET - REAR

171-1269 DELCO

NAPA FT8523

171-1269 supercedes  171-1032

114 9 EA 20085 CHALK TREAD RUBBER

WHITE

115 48 CN 20145 FUEL QUICK START

SPRAY 11 OZ (ETHER)

116 576 CN 20185 CLEANER DISC BRAKE

SPRAY 14 OZ

NON-CHLORINATED FOR USE ON DISC, DRUM,

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

ABS BRAKES  

117 11 CN 20202 GLEAM BEAM HEADLIGHT $9.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CLEANER       444109  

118 89 CN 20291 FLUID POWER STEERING $2.69 No Bid $3.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid

12 OZ  

119 5 KT 20401 WARNING TRIANGLE FLARE KIT $20.66 $15.88 $31.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid

SIGANAL STAT 798, PM 449, K-D 610-4645,  

GROTE 71422, TRUCKLITE 97974   

SET OF THREE COMPLETE TRIANGLES WITH CASE  

120 46 EA 20406 FIRST AID KIT AUTO $8.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.40

NORTH 10 PERSON KIT  

NORTH P/N 019708-0005L, SAS 6010-01   

KIT COMES IN PLASTIC CASE  

121 23 EA 20777 COUPLER PLUG "A" STYLE $2.68 $2.94 $1.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid

MILTON 777 MALE   NAPA 90-618SS  



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

ABS BRAKES

117 11 CN 20202 GLEAM BEAM HEADLIGHT

CLEANER       444109

118 89 CN 20291 FLUID POWER STEERING

12 OZ

119 5 KT 20401 WARNING TRIANGLE FLARE KIT

SIGANAL STAT 798, PM 449, K-D 610-4645,

GROTE 71422, TRUCKLITE 97974

SET OF THREE COMPLETE TRIANGLES WITH CASE

120 46 EA 20406 FIRST AID KIT AUTO

NORTH 10 PERSON KIT

NORTH P/N 019708-0005L, SAS 6010-01

KIT COMES IN PLASTIC CASE

121 23 EA 20777 COUPLER PLUG "A" STYLE

MILTON 777 MALE   NAPA 90-618SS

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

122 102 GL 20850 ANTIFREEZE/COOLANT H/D $9.79 No Bid $8.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid

DIESEL    PURPLE HD1GAL  

MEETS CAT,CUMMINS,DETROIT DIESEL,MTU,   

FREIGHTLINER,JOHN DEERE,NAVISTAR, TMC,  

VOLVO/MACK SPECS. ALSO MEETS ASTM D 3306   

ASTM D 4340, ASTM D 4985, ASTM D 6210,  

ASTM D 5345 (50% BLEND) SPECS.   

FULL STRENGTH

123 5 GL 20862 ANTIFREEZE HEAVY DUTY $10.62 No Bid $16.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid

NITRITE FREE EXTENDED  

LIFE ANTIFREEZE/COOLANT

WITH ORGANIC ACID TECHNOLOGY (OAT)

PN ZRX 846439

124 33 DR 30003 AERIAL DEVICES HYDRAULIC $535.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

OIL  ISO-AW 68  55 GL/DR

PREMIUM QUALITY GENERAL PURPOSE ANTI-



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

122 102 GL 20850 ANTIFREEZE/COOLANT H/D

DIESEL    PURPLE HD1GAL

MEETS CAT,CUMMINS,DETROIT DIESEL,MTU,

FREIGHTLINER,JOHN DEERE,NAVISTAR, TMC,

VOLVO/MACK SPECS. ALSO MEETS ASTM D 3306

ASTM D 4340, ASTM D 4985, ASTM D 6210,

ASTM D 5345 (50% BLEND) SPECS.

FULL STRENGTH

123 5 GL 20862 ANTIFREEZE HEAVY DUTY

NITRITE FREE EXTENDED

LIFE ANTIFREEZE/COOLANT

WITH ORGANIC ACID TECHNOLOGY (OAT)

PN ZRX 846439

124 33 DR 30003 AERIAL DEVICES HYDRAULIC

OIL  ISO-AW 68  55 GL/DR

PREMIUM QUALITY GENERAL PURPOSE ANTI-

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

     

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

     

$379.75 $475.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

WEAR HYDRAULIC FLUID

AIRCRAFT TYPE HYDRAULIC OIL --  

NON CONDUCTIVE

125 2 CS 30045 OIL MOTOR NON DETERGENT No Bid No Bid $4.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid

SAE30W        12QT/CASE  

NAPA 75-110

126 7 PL 30110 JCB HYDRAULIC OIL $48.50 No Bid $69.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4002/1602I     5 GL/PAIL

AW46

NAPA 85-805

127 3 PL 30115 KOMATSU HYDRAULIC OIL $48.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

KM 1400501H1   5 GL/PAIL

128 23 DR 30120 OIL MOTOR 5 W 20 $585.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

55 GL DRUM THAT MEETS API

CERTIFICATION AND FORD SPEC WSS-M2C153-H  

THIS IS AN ALL-SEASON SYNTHETIC BLEND OIL



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

WEAR HYDRAULIC FLUID

AIRCRAFT TYPE HYDRAULIC OIL --

NON CONDUCTIVE

125 2 CS 30045 OIL MOTOR NON DETERGENT

SAE30W        12QT/CASE

NAPA 75-110

126 7 PL 30110 JCB HYDRAULIC OIL

4002/1602I     5 GL/PAIL

AW46

NAPA 85-805

127 3 PL 30115 KOMATSU HYDRAULIC OIL

KM 1400501H1   5 GL/PAIL

128 23 DR 30120 OIL MOTOR 5 W 20

55 GL DRUM THAT MEETS API

CERTIFICATION AND FORD SPEC WSS-M2C153-H

THIS IS AN ALL-SEASON SYNTHETIC BLEND OIL

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$396.25 $485.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

    



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description Clark Power 
Services Truck Pro Fisher Auto Parts Ken Smith Auto 

Parts
General Rubber 

& Plastics
Summers 
Industrial

VARIOUS FLEET MAINTENANCE ITEMS
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

129 2 PL 30141 KUBOTA SUPER UDT2 TRANS $52.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

70000-40205

130 6 DR 30190 OIL MOTOR 0 W 40 $23.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

SYNTHETIC    55 GAL DRUM

131 1 RL 51250 CORD NYLON   3/16"DIA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#G1012S0475   475 FT RL



 Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement 

 The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

MINUTES BID OPENING
1/7/2025

 4:00 P.M.

# Qty. U/M Part # Description

   
 The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

129 2 PL 30141 KUBOTA SUPER UDT2 TRANS

70000-40205

130 6 DR 30190 OIL MOTOR 0 W 40

SYNTHETIC    55 GAL DRUM

131 1 RL 51250 CORD NYLON   3/16"DIA

#G1012S0475   475 FT RL

Hutchens Petrolium
Noble Oil 

Company dba 
Saftey Kleen

Best One Tire 
Service

Monro Inc.
Free Service Tire

Southern Tire 
Mart

   

No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$1,320.00 $1,245.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid  

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid


	Table 1

